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Paul Schow has agreed to 
supply Mai Tais.  (Yeah 
Paul). Come one come all 
and enjoy the fun if you 
are on property even if 
you are not playing. 
 
As this Phantom Reporter 
understands, Bill Green 
will be returning to defend 
his “Title”. Last years 
near sighted or far sighted 
or whatever, Judges 
Parker Fritschle and Joe 
Brakovec will return to 
lead or provoke us.  Jim 
Vasilas will again be our 
accurate score keeper. 
“Photo Flora” will I hope 
be doing her great things. 
 
As usual our retired “Shoe 
Thief” Judge Lew will be 
lurking in the bushes so  
protect your shoes. 
 
All contributions to the 
MKV Annual Shuffle-
board Underground News-
letter, Money, Bribes, Ar-
ticles or Comments will be 
greatly appreciated. Con-
tact the Publisher (Barbie) 
at Unit 211. 
 

That’s all folks 
 

The Phantom Reporter 
 

Keep Smiling 
 

Be Happy 

“TIS THE SEASON”. 
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Early Bird Sign Up 
Special  

“And to All the Ships at 
Sea”. 
 
This year the Shuffleboard 
Tournament Directors are 
Teri Jones @  1 (714) 309-
1535 and Mary Mayers @ 
7166 (Two of our Most Pres-
tigious Girls on Campus).   
 
(The best time to phone is 3 
a.m.- Please do not disturb 
Mary Lou). 
 
The 2009 entry fee is $2.00 
per person or $5 per couple 
(?) (as the directors want 
exact change). No credit 
cards or checks will be ac-
cepted. 
 
Sign up sheets will be at the 
annual meeting. 
 
The tournament will be held 
between February 1st and 
February 28th.  
 
This will not interfere with 
the  “Free Dinner on the 
Beach, Bring Your Own 
Food” scheduled for Febru-
ary 29th.  Last year it was 
held on February 30th. 
 
The partner selection proc-
ess and pupu party will be 
held Wednesday, January 
28th at 5 p.m. in the library.   
All are invited. Please bring 
a pupu and any beverage 
you wish to imbibe.  

 

 
 

The Publisher accepts no  
responsibility or liability for the  

authenticity or accuracy of any of 
the articles in any edition. 

 
Contributions are welcomed. 


